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Inspirational 
After the Shadows 
by Amanda Cabot 
R CABOT Amanda 
SECRETS 1  
A young widow returns to 
her hometown and finds 
that the new schoolteacher 
holds the key to her 
father’s mysterious death 
and to her heart.  
 
Hooked on You 
by Kathleen Fuller 
R FULLER Kathleen 
When her grandmother 
injures herself, Riley must 
return to her hometown to 
help run the family yarn 
store.  
 
Promises and Primroses 
by Josi Kilpack 
R KILPACK Josi 
Lord Mayfield offers an 
inheritance to his nieces 
and nephews if they agree 
to choose worthy spouses. 
 
Remember Me 
by Tracie Peterson 
R PETERSON Tracie 
PICTURES 1  
Reunited with an old 
flame, Addie must make a 
decision about her future 
and faith when her ugly 
past surfaces. 
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D’Vaughn and Kris Plan 
a Wedding 
by Chencia Higgins 
R HIGGINS Chencia 
For a reality TV show, 
D’Vaughn and Kris have 
convinced their families  
they’re getting married.  
 
I’m So (Not) Over You 
by Kosoko Jackson 
R JACKSON Kosoko 
Kian reluctantly agrees to 
act as his ex-boyfriend’s 
boyfriend while his parents 
are in town.  
 
One Last Stop 
by Casey McQuiston 
R MCQUISTON Casey 
August starts to believe in 
the impossible when she 
meets Jane, who is from 
the 1970s and trying to 
find her way back.  
 

Paranormal 
Enchanted to Meet You 
by Meg Cabot 
R CABOT Meg WITCHES 
1  
In her teenage years, 
Jessica cast a spell that 
went wrong and brought 
her a lifetime ban from the 
World Council of Witches. 
So no one is more 
surprised than Jess when, 
years later, a handsome 
WCW member shows up 
and claims that Jess is the 
Chosen One.  

Chance of a Lifetime 
by Jude Deveraux 
R DEVERAUX Jude 
PROVIDENCE 1  
A 19th-century thief atones 
for misdeeds by 
convincing the present-day 
woman he loves to marry 
another.  
 
Sound of Darkness 
by Heather Graham 
R GRAHAM Heather 
KREWE 36  
Rookie FBI agent Colleen, 
who can “hear” people, 
teams up with Mark to 
bring a monster to justice.  
 
The Awakening 
by Nora Roberts 
R ROBERTS Nora 
DRAGON 1  
A woman visits Ireland, 
where she uncovers truths 
about her destiny in a 
fantastical world.  
 
Lover Arisen 
by J.R. Ward 
R WARD J.R. BLACK 20 
Possessed by a demon, 
Balthazar is once again on 
the hunt and fighting an 
undeniable attraction to a 
woman.  



 

Contemporary 
The Spanish Love 
Deception 
by Elena Armas 
R ARAMAS Elena 
Catalina needs a date to 
her sister's wedding. 
Aaron--her handsome, 
rude colleague--offers to 
step in.  
 
Honey and Spice 
by Bolu Babalola 
R BABALOLA Bolu 
A woman with a radio 
show finds her show and 
her reputation on the line 
after she publicly makes 
out with a man she 
denounced.  
 
Business Not as Usual 
by Sharon Cooper 
R COOPER Sharon 
When Dreamy catches the 
attention of her boss's 
potential investor, Dreamy 
has to remind herself to 
focus on her career goals 
so she can be her own 
boss. Who cares if he has 
the social grace of the 
Duke of Sussex?  
 
Getting His Game Back 
by Gia De Cadenet 
R DE CADENET Gia 
Barbershop owner Khalil 
meets customer Vanessa, 
who thought she was too 
busy to be distracted by a 
relationship.  

The Singles Table 
by Sara Desai 
R DESAI Sara 
Opposites attract in this 
romantic comedy about a 
lawyer who is determined 
to find the perfect match at 
her cousin's wedding.  
 
Pride, Prejudice, and 
other Flavors 
by Sonali Dev 
R DEV Sonali RAJES 1 
A neurosurgeon from a 
politically ambitious 
immigrant family clashes 
with a talented dessert 
chef who would prove he 
is more than his pedigree.  
 
Beach Read 
by Emily Henry 
R HENRY Emily 
An acclaimed but blocked 
literary master and a best-
selling novelist who has 
stopped believing in true 
love agree to a summer-
long writing project that 
challenges them.  
 
Lucie Yi is Not a 
Romantic 
by Lauren Ho 
R HO Lauren 
An ambitious career 
woman signs up for a co-
parenting website only to 
find a match she never 
expected, in this 
unflinchingly funny and 
honest story. 

A Song of Secrets 
by Jayci Lee 
R LEE Jayci HANA 1 
Cellist Angie Han needs to 
save her trio's chamber 
music society. When she 
discovers a secret about 
her ex, they agree to an 
uneasy truce. 
 
The Banned Bookshop 
of Maggie Banks 
by Shauna Robinson 
R ROBINSON Shauna 
Bookstore manager 
Maggie starts an 
underground book club 
that unearths a town 
secret. 
 

Historical 
Remember Love 
by Mary Balogh 
R BALOGH Mary 
RAVENSWOOD 1  
Exiled as a traitor from his 
family, Devlin is called 
home six years later when 
he realizes he still has 
feelings for Gwyneth, 
whom he lost after his 
family banished him.  
 
Silver Lady 
by Mary Jo Putney 
R PUTNEY Mary Jo 2023 
A dashing nobleman and a 
beautiful stranger with a 
mysterious gift discover 
they share a powerful 
passion, a unique legacy 
and a common enemy.  

Highland Wolf 
by Lynsay Sands 
R SANDS Lynsay 
HIGHLAND 10 
Believed to have been 
killed, a Highland warrior 
returns to reclaim his 
birthright and his 
betrothed. 
 

LGBTQ 
Can’t Let Her Go 
by Kianna Alexander 
R ALEXANDER Kianna 
2023 
Friends to lovers? There’s 
a lot to consider, a lot to 
hope for, and a lot at risk 
in this steamy and 
emotional romance. 
 
Written in the Stars 
by Alexandria Bellefleur 
R BELLEFLEUR 
Alexandria WRITTEN 1 
Inspired by Pride and 
Prejudice, a social media 
astrologer agrees to a fake 
relationship with a no-
nonsense actuary. 
 
Queerly Beloved 
by Susie Dumond 
R DUMOND Susie 
A people-pleasing 
bridesmaid-for-hire falls 
for the crushable new 
lesbian in town. Will she 
finally find her happily 
ever after—and her own 
voice?  
  


